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SBI- SAMBALPUR BAZAR, CIVIL WORKS 
BILL OF QUANTITIES  
(RATE NOT TO BE FILLED) 

S.No ITEM SPECIFICATION UNIT QTY 

1 Flooring 
  

a Vitrified Tiles Flooring 
  

  

Providing and laying 600mm x 600mm nano polished double charged 
vitrified shine tiles of Jonson/ Nitco/ Kajaria/RAK or equivalent make with 
water absorption less than 0.08% and confirming to IS: 15622 of approved 
make, in all colours and shades, laid on 20 mm thk. cement mortar 1;4 (1 
Cement : 4 Coarse Sand), including grouting the joints with white cement 
and matching pigment etc. all complete, including cost of all materials, 
labour, T&P etc. required for the work. 

SQM 180 

2 Painting Works     
A Internal Wall Painting     

  

Providing and applying two or more coats of Acrylic Emlusion paint to 
internal walls, columns, beams ceiling etc. Over a coat of primer as per 
manufacturer's specification including all labour and materials complete in 
all floors of approved make and shade. 

SQM 800 

B Wall Putty on Internal Surfaces Only     
  Providing 2.0 mm thick of Birla white wall care putty (Water resistant white 

cement based putty for concrete mortar walls and ceiling) after removing all 
loosely adhering material from the wall surface of 1 mm thickness. 

SQM 400 

C Providing and applying two or more coats enamel paint to door and 
windows, MS works of approved shade and make SQM 100 

3 Brick Masonry work in cement mortar (1:6) in full Brick thick walls using K.B. 
Bricks having minimum crushing strength of 50 kg/ cm2 after immersing the 
bricks for 24 hours in water before use with all necessary projections, as per 
design chamfering, watering and curing etc. including cost, conveyance, 
royalties and taxes of all material and cost of etc. complete. 

CUM 2 

4 Providing and laying 16 mm thick cement plaster in proportion 1:6 to all 
levels to external/internal surface of the wall with sand cement mortar 
including racking out joints roughning the concrete surface rounding off 
chamfering & filling of the porturated surface of the brick where necessary 
as per direction including working in narrow width with cost of all labour, 
materials scaffoilding etc complete in all floors in all respect as required for 
the completion of the work 

SQM 100 

 
 
 
 
  


